
 1 - #4889 Cheese 2 - #4890 Chicken 3 - #4891 Grains 4 - #4892 5 - #4893 6 - #4894 Plant-based 7 - #4895 

Bake Crafters 
1 Cheddar  2 Mozzarella 

No Bid 
3 Patty 
No Bid

4 Tenders 5 Meatball 
 No Bid No Bid 

6 Biscuit 
($ 53,374.51) 

7 Roll 
($     28,149.88) ($ 

8 Pancake 
    13,192.52) 

9 Grape Jelly 
No Bid 

10 Olive Oil 
No Bid 

11 Sausage 
Link 

12 Crumble 13 Slices 14 Butternut Tots 15 Broccoli 
No Bid Tots 

16 Cauliflower 
Tots

17 Shrimp
No Bid

 Beetnik No Bid No Bid  No Bid ($ 117,108.75) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
 Boundary Bend No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($      30,720.00) No Bid No Bid
 Braun Beef ($  61,836.00) ($  42,562.50) ($    128,400.00)  No Bid No Bid ($ 54,499.10) ($     29,160.56) ($     18,522.00) No Bid No Bid ($      88,798.50) ($    40,410.00) No Bid No Bid
 Bridgford Foods No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid ($ 64,072.48) ($     23,736.70) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
 Das Jam Haus No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid ($      42,675.47) No Bid No Bid No Bid
 Gaucho Gourmet No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($      30,612.00) No Bid No Bid
 Golden Platter Foods No Bid ($    104,400.00) ($                          78,750.00) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($      56,700.00) ($    32,400.00) ($   31,950.00) ($           24,793.20) ($       24,793.20) ($           24,793.20) No Bid
 Green Leaf Foods No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($      65,205.00) ($    37,800.00) ($   33,570.00) No Bid No Bid

      Longhorn Meat Market ($ 75,600.00) ($ 58,875.00) ($ 225,000.00) ($                        218,812.50) ($ 82,456.25) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($       2,912.50)
 Mrs. Millers Homemade 
Jams  Perdue 

No Bid 
No Bid ($    

No Bid
112,800.00) ($ 

 No Bid No Bid 
464,625.00) ($ 232,875.00)($ 59,493.75) 

No Bid 
No Bid 

($      26,577.25) 
No Bid 

No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid
No Bid 

AISD Frozen & Dry Specialty Foods 
IFB #20AUC008 (Sorcity #4888) 
Bid Tabulation

Legend:
Organic Price 




