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UNIT PRICE/ EXTENDED DELIVERY TIME ADDITIONAL

VENDOR BRAND NAME/ITEM# CASE PRICE PRICING OFFERS

Liberty Paper Premier - Items #PRE811W 24.65$            $               616,250.00 2-5 Days Did not meet bid specifications.  

Veritiv Operating Company Comet / U31473 - Item #U31473 24.69$            $               617,250.00 5-7 Days Did not meet bid specifications.  

Contract Paper Group Inc. Fascopy-Domestic - Item FWH11 25.14$            $               628,500.00 5-10 Days Pricing based on full truckloads AWARD PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 

Magtec Corporation
Xerographic Paper by Ledesma-Item 

Xerographic
25.25$            3 Months 2-3 Business Days

Clampitt Paper Company Pixelle Go! 222761 - Item #58261428 25.85$            $               646,250.00 5-7 Days ARO

Olmsted-Kirk IP Relay #13020 Item #3490.053820 26.78$            $               669,500.00 2-4 Business Days

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC Staples / 324791 - Item #324791 26.99$            $               674,750.00 7-10 Days Full Truckload Orders Only

Western Brw - Bosworth Domtar Copy #2750 - Item #2750 27.75$            $               693,750.00 5-10 Work Days

Office Depot Boise x9 27.99$            $               699,750.00 7-9 Days

Schoolocker Teacher Supply Boise BSPLOL1120 - Item #L1120 39.90$            $               997,500.00 5-7 Business Days
Please call with freight quote, if 

applicable. Payable within 7 days of 

order received.

UNIT PRICE/ EXTENDED DELIVERY TIME ADDITIONAL

VENDOR BRAND NAME/ITEM# CASE PRICE ARO PRICING OFFERS

Olmsted-Kirk Report / 21032454 Item #6417.851124 41.35$            $                 14,472.50 1-3 Business Days Did not meet bid specifications.  

Western Brw - Bosworth Dortar Image Print #3918 - Item #3918 42.50$            $                 14,875.00 4-7 Work Days AWARD PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 

Office Depot Boise Polaris  48.09$            $                 16,831.50 7-9 Days

Clampitt Paper Company Boise Polaris 98br - Item #570007 61.90$            $                 21,665.00 3-5 Days ARO

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC Xerox / 3R11540 - Item #560699 62.79$            $                 21,976.50 1-2 Days

Schoolocker Teacher Supply Domtar 3918 - Item 3918 88.80$            $                 31,080.00 5-7 Business Days
Please call with freight quote, if 

applicable. Payable within 7 days of 
Contract Paper Group Inc. NO BID

Liberty Paper NO BID

Magtec Corporation NO BID

Veritiv Operating Company NO BID

UNIT PRICE/ EXTENDED DELIVERY TIME ADDITIONAL

VENDOR BRAND NAME/ITEM# REAM PRICE ARO PRICING OFFERS

Clampitt Paper Company Pixelle Go! 222772 - Item #58262032 4.02$              $                   3,015.00 5-7 Days ARO AWARD PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 

Contract Paper Group Inc. Fascopy/Equal - Item #FWH14 4.03$              $                   3,022.50 7-21 Days

Olmsted-Kirk IP Relay / 13021 Item #3490.053840 4.10$              $                   3,075.00 1-3 Business Days

Western Brw - Bosworth Domtar Copy #2752 - Item #2752 4.15$              $                   3,112.50 2-3 Days

Office Depot Boise 4.30$              $                   3,225.00 7-9 Days

Veritiv Operating Company Econosource - Item #U5021 4.43$              $                   3,322.50 5-7 Days

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC Staples /  126987 - Items #126987 4.70$              $                   3,525.00 7-10 Days

Schoolocker Teacher Supply Boise 196643 - Item #196643 6.99$              $                   5,242.50 5-7 Business Days
Please call with freight quote, if 

applicable. Payable within 7 days of 

order received.

Liberty Paper NO BID

Magtec Corporation NO BID

ITEM 1 – MULTI-PURPOSE PAPER, WHITE, 8.5 x 11 inch, 20 LB, 500 sheets per wrapped ream, 10 reams per case, Brightness %: 92. This paper must be suitable for 

high speed copier, duplicator, press and laser printer use.  Specifications:  Domtar, Spectrum, Boise or buyer approved equal. 

ITEM 2 – MULTI-PURPOSE PAPER, WHITE, 8.5 x 11 inch, 24 LB, 500 sheets per wrapped ream, 10 reams per case, Brightness %: 98. This paper must be suitable for 

high speed copier, duplicator, press and laser printer use.  Specifications:  Domtar ImagePrint multiuse 24# or buyer approved equal. Delivery: There will multiple 

deliveries on an as needed basis to the following address:  PRINT SHOP                                                                                                         

ITEM 3 – MULTI-PURPOSE PAPER, WHITE, 8.5 x 14 inch, 20 LB, 500 sheets per wrapped ream, 10 reams per case, Brightness %: 92. This paper must be suitable for 

high speed copier, duplicator, press and laser printer use.  Specifications:  Domtar, Spectrum, Boise or buyer approved equal. 
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UNIT PRICE/ EXTENDED DELIVERY TIME ADDITIONAL

VENDOR BRAND NAME/ITEM# REAM PRICE ARO PRICING OFFERS

Contract Paper Group Inc. Fascopy/Equal - Item #FWH17 5.76$              $                 11,520.00 7-21 Days AWARD PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 

Clampitt Paper Company Pixelle Go! 222794 - Item #58262033 6.14$              $                 12,280.00 5-7 Days ARO

Olmsted-Kirk IP Relay / 13023 Item #3490.053860 6.45$              $                 12,900.00 1-3 Business Days

Veritiv Operating Company Econosource - Item #U50220 6.69$              $                 13,920.00 5-7 Days

Office Depot Boise 7.14$              $                 14,280.00 7-9 Days

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC Staples / 512215 - Items #512215 7.22$              $                 14,440.00 7-10 Days

Schoolocker Teacher Supply Boise 196652 - Item #196652 9.87$              $                 19,740.00 
Please call with freight quote, if 

applicable. Payable within 7 days of 

order received.

Western Brw - Bosworth Domtar Copy #2753 - Item #2753 13.04$            $                 26,080.00 2-3 Days

Liberty Paper NO BID

Magtec Corporation NO BID

DELIVERY TIME ADDITIONAL

VENDOR SPECIFICATION

QUANTITY / 

 REAM BRAND NAME/ITEM# UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE ARO PRICING OFFERS

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC Neenah 22521 Lunar Blue or equal 1,000             
Neenah Astrobrights/ 

22521
6.41$                   6,410.00$                                  7-10 Days AWARD PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC Neenah 22541 Gamma Green or equal 1,000             
Neenah 

Astrobrights/22541
6.41$                   6,410.00$                                  7-10 Days AWARD PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC Neenah 22551 Re-Entry Red or equal 1,000             
Neenah 

Astrobrights/22551
6.41$                   6,410.00$                                  7-10 Days AWARD PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC Neenah 22571 Galaxy Gold or equal 1,000             
Neenah 

Astrobrights/22571
6.41$                   6,410.00$                                  7-10 Days AWARD PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 

Contract Paper Group Inc. Neenah 22521 Lunar Blue or equal 1,000             Astrobrights 6.69$                   6,690.00$                                  7-21 Days

Contract Paper Group Inc. Neenah 22541 Gamma Green or equal 1,000             Astrobrights 6.69$                   6,690.00$                                  7-21 Days

Contract Paper Group Inc. Neenah 22551 Re-Entry Red or equal 1,000             Astrobrights 6.69$                   6,690.00$                                  7-21 Days

Contract Paper Group Inc. Neenah 22571 Galaxy Gold or equal 1,000             Astrobrights 6.69$                   6,690.00$                                  7-21 Days TOTAL EXTENDED $26,760.00

Office Depot Neenah 22521 Lunar Blue or equal 1,000             Neenah 22521 6.74$                   6,740.00$                                  7-9 Days

Office Depot Neenah 22541 Gamma Green or equal 1,000             Neenah 22541 6.74$                   6,740.00$                                  7-9 Days

Office Depot Neenah 22551 Re-Entry Red or equal 1,000             Neenah 22551 6.74$                   6,740.00$                                  7-9 Days

Office Depot Neenah 22571 Galaxy Gold or equal 1,000             Neenah 22571 6.74$                   6,740.00$                                  7-9 Days

Western Brw - Bosworth Neenah 22521 Lunar Blue or equal 1,000             
Neenah Astrobrights 

#22521
6.85$                   6,850.00$                                  4-7 Work Days

Western Brw - Bosworth Neenah 22541 Gamma Green or equal 1,000             Astrobrights #22541 6.85$                   6,850.00$                                  4-7 Work Days

Western Brw - Bosworth Neenah 22551 Re-Entry Red or equal 1,000             Astrobrights #22551 6.85$                   6,850.00$                                  4-7 Work Days

Western Brw - Bosworth Neenah 22571 Galaxy Gold or equal 1,000             Astrobrights #22571 6.85$                   6,850.00$                                  4-7 Work Days

Olmsted-Kirk Neenah 22521 Lunar Blue or equal 1,000             
Astrobrights 

4715.022521
7.05$                   7,050.00$                                  1-3 Working Days

Olmsted-Kirk Neenah 22541 Gamma Green or equal 1,000             
Astrobrights 

4715.022541
7.05$                   7,050.00$                                  1-3 Working Days

Olmsted-Kirk Neenah 22551 Re-Entry Red or equal 1,000             
Astrobrights 

4715.022551
7.05$                   7,050.00$                                  1-3 Working Days

Olmsted-Kirk Neenah 22571 Galaxy Gold or equal 1,000             
Astrobrights 

4715.022571
7.05$                   7,050.00$                                  1-3 Working Days

Clampitt Paper Company Neenah 22521 Lunar Blue or equal 1,000             
Neenah 22521 Lunar 

Blue or equal
7.69$                   7,690.00$                                  3-5 Days ARO

Clampitt Paper Company Neenah 22541 Gamma Green or equal 1,000             
Neenah 22541 Gamma 

Green or equal
7.69$                   7,690.00$                                  3-5 Days ARO

Clampitt Paper Company Neenah 22551 Re-Entry Red or equal 1,000             
Neenah 22551 Re-

Entry Red or equal
7.69$                   7,690.00$                                  3-5 Days ARO

Clampitt Paper Company Neenah 22571 Galaxy Gold or equal 1,000             
Neenah 22571 Galaxy 

Gold or equal
7.69$                   7,690.00$                                  3-5 Days ARO

Schoolocker Teacher Supply Neenah 22521 Lunar Blue or equal 1,000             Neenah 22521 16.99$                 16,990.00$                                5-7 Business Days
Please call with freight quote, if applicable. Payable 

within 7 days of order received.

ITEM 5 – MULTI-PURPOSE PAPER, BRIGHT colored, 8.5 x 11 inch, 24 LB, 500 sheets per wrapped ream, 10 reams per case. This paper must be suitable for high speed copier, duplicator, press and laser printer use.  Specifications:  Neenah 

Astrobrights or buyer approved equal. 

ITEM 4 – MULTI-PURPOSE PAPER, WHITE, 11 x 17 inch, 20 LB, 500 sheets per wrapped ream,  Brightness %:92, 10 reams per case. This paper must be suitable for high 

speed copier, duplicator, press and laser printer use.  Specifications:  Domtar, Spectru;m, Boise or buyer approved equal. 
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Schoolocker Teacher Supply Neenah 22541 Gamma Green or equal 1,000             Neenah 22541 16.99$                 16,990.00$                                5-7 Business Days
Please call with freight quote, if applicable. Payable 

within 7 days of order received.

Schoolocker Teacher Supply Neenah 22551 Re-Entry Red or equal 1,000             Neenah 22551 16.99$                 16,990.00$                                5-7 Business Days
Please call with freight quote, if applicable. Payable 

within 7 days of order received.

Schoolocker Teacher Supply Neenah 22571 Galaxy Gold or equal 1,000             Neenah 22571 16.99$                 16,990.00$                                5-7 Business Days
Please call with freight quote, if applicable. Payable 

within 7 days of order received.

Liberty Paper Neenah 22521 Lunar Blue or equal 1,000             NO BID

Liberty Paper Neenah 22541 Gamma Green or equal 1,000             NO BID

Liberty Paper Neenah 22551 Re-Entry Red or equal 1,000             NO BID

Liberty Paper Neenah 22571 Galaxy Gold or equal 1,000             NO BID

Magtec Corporation Neenah 22521 Lunar Blue or equal 1,000             NO BID

Magtec Corporation Neenah 22541 Gamma Green or equal 1,000             NO BID

Magtec Corporation Neenah 22551 Re-Entry Red or equal 1,000             NO BID

Magtec Corporation Neenah 22571 Galaxy Gold or equal 1,000             NO BID

Veritiv Operating Company Neenah 22521 Lunar Blue or equal 1,000             NO BID

Veritiv Operating Company Neenah 22541 Gamma Green or equal 1,000             NO BID

Veritiv Operating Company Neenah 22551 Re-Entry Red or equal 1,000             NO BID

Veritiv Operating Company Neenah 22571 Galaxy Gold or equal 1,000             NO BID
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DELIVERY TIME ADDITIONAL

VENDOR SPECIFICATION

QUANTITY / 

REAM BRAND NAME/ITEM# UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE ARO PRICING OFFERS

Contract Paper Group Inc. Blue (Domtar 81199) 2500 REAMS Fireworx 3.70$                   9,242.50$                                  7-21 Days AWARD PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 

Contract Paper Group Inc. Canary Yellow (Domtar 81196) 2500 REAMS Fireworx 3.70$                   9,242.50$                                  7-21 Days AWARD PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 

Contract Paper Group Inc. Green (Domtar 81197) 2500 REAMS Fireworx 3.70$                   9,242.50$                                  7-21 Days AWARD PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 

Contract Paper Group Inc. Pink (Domtar 81198) 2500 REAMS Fireworx 3.70$                   9,242.50$                                  7-21 Days AWARD PENDING BOARD APPROVAL   TOTAL $36,970.00

Clampitt Paper Company Blue (Domtar 81199) 2500 REAMS

Bottle Rocket Blue 

Boise Fireworx 

MP2201BE

3.87$                   9,675.00$                                  3-5 Days ARO

Clampitt Paper Company Canary Yellow (Domtar 81196) 2500 REAMS
Crackling Canary Boise 

Fireworx MP2201CY
3.87$                   9,675.00$                                  3-5 Days ARO

Clampitt Paper Company Green (Domtar 81197) 2500 REAMS

Popper-Mint Green 

Boise Fireworx 

MP2201GN

3.87$                   9,675.00$                                  3-5 Days ARO

Clampitt Paper Company Pink (Domtar 81198) 2500 REAMS
Powder Pink Boise 

Fireworxs MP2201PK
3.87$                   9,675.00$                                  3-5 Days ARO

Veritiv Operating Company Blue (Domtar 81199) 2500 REAMS Fireworx / MP2201BE 3.97$                   9,925.00$                                  5-7 Days

Veritiv Operating Company Canary Yellow (Domtar 81196) 2500 REAMS Fireworx / MP2201CY 3.97$                   9,925.00$                                  5-7 Days

Veritiv Operating Company Green (Domtar 81197) 2500 REAMS Fireworx / MP2201GN 3.97$                   9,925.00$                                  5-7 Days

Veritiv Operating Company Pink (Domtar 81198) 2500 REAMS Fireworx / MP2201PK 3.97$                   9,925.00$                                  5-7 Days

Western Brw - Bosworth Blue (Domtar 81199) 2500 REAMS
Domtar Earth Choice 

Multipurpose #81199
4.04$                   10,100.00$                                4-7 Work Days

Western Brw - Bosworth Canary Yellow (Domtar 81196) 2500 REAMS
Domtar Earth Choice 

Multipurpose #81196
4.04$                   10,100.00$                                4-7 Work Days

Western Brw - Bosworth Green (Domtar 81197) 2500 REAMS
Domtar Earth Choice 

Multipurpose #81197
4.04$                   10,100.00$                                4-7 Work Days

Western Brw - Bosworth Pink (Domtar 81198) 2500 REAMS
Domtar Earth Choice 

Multipurpose #81198
4.04$                   10,100.00$                                4-7 Work Days

Olmsted-Kirk Blue (Domtar 81199) 2500 REAMS
Hammermill Colors 

3490-008820
4.35$                   10,875.00$                                1-3 Work Days

Olmsted-Kirk Canary Yellow (Domtar 81196) 2500 REAMS
Hammermill Colors 

3490-008830
4.35$                   10,875.00$                                1-3 Work Days

Olmsted-Kirk Green (Domtar 81197) 2500 REAMS
Hammermill Colors 

3490-008840
4.35$                   10,875.00$                                1-3 Work Days

Olmsted-Kirk Pink (Domtar 81198) 2500 REAMS
Hammermill Colors 

3490-008810
4.35$                   10,875.00$                                1-3 Work Days

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC Blue (Domtar 81199) 2500 REAMS
Staples Pastels / 

490947
4.36$                   10,900.00$                                7-10 Days

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC Canary Yellow (Domtar 81196) 2500 REAMS
Staples Pastels / 

490948
4.36$                   10,900.00$                                7-10 Days

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC Green (Domtar 81197) 2500 REAMS
Staples Pastels / 

490936
4.36$                   10,900.00$                                7-10 Days

Staples Contract & Commercial LLC Pink (Domtar 81198) 2500 REAMS
Staples Pastels / 

490935
4.36$                   10,900.00$                                7-10 Days

Office Depot Blue (Domtar 81199) 2500 REAMS Domtar 81199 4.40$                   11,000.00$                                7-9 Days

Office Depot Canary Yellow (Domtar 81196) 2500 REAMS Domtar 81196 4.40$                   11,000.00$                                7-9 Days

Office Depot Green (Domtar 81197) 2500 REAMS Domtar 81197 4.40$                   11,000.00$                                7-9 Days

Office Depot Pink (Domtar 81198) 2500 REAMS Domtar 81198 4.40$                   11,000.00$                                7-9 Days

Schoolocker Teacher Supply Blue (Domtar 81199) 2500 REAMS Hammermill 199 7.50$                   18,750.00$                                5-7 Business Days

Please call with freight quote, if applicable. Payable 

within 7 days of order received.  *Do have Domtar out 

of stock.  Available Nov 21, 2019.  Item numbers above 

as note $8.50 per ream-extended 21250.00

Schoolocker Teacher Supply Canary Yellow (Domtar 81196) 2500 REAMS Hammermill 196 7.50$                   18,750.00$                                5-7 Business Days

Please call with freight quote, if applicable. Payable 

within 7 days of order received.  *Do have Domtar out 

of stock.  Available Nov 21, 2019.  Item numbers above 

as note $8.50 per ream-extended 21250.00

Schoolocker Teacher Supply Green (Domtar 81197) 2500 REAMS Hammermill 197 7.50$                   18,750.00$                                5-7 Business Days

Please call with freight quote, if applicable. Payable 

within 7 days of order received.  *Do have Domtar out 

of stock.  Available Nov 21, 2019.  Item numbers above 

as note $8.50 per ream-extended 21250.00

Schoolocker Teacher Supply Pink (Domtar 81198) 2500 REAMS Hammermill 198 7.50$                   18,750.00$                                5-7 Business Days

Please call with freight quote, if applicable. Payable 

within 7 days of order received.  *Do have Domtar out 

of stock.  Available Nov 21, 2019.  Item numbers above 

as note $8.50 per ream-extended 21250.00

Liberty Paper Blue (Domtar 81199) 2500 REAMS NO BID

ITEM 6 - MULTI-PURPOSE PASTEL COLORED PAPER 8.5 x 11 inch, 20 LB sheets per wrapped ream, 10 reams per case. This paper must be suitable for high speed copier, duplicator, press and laser printer use.  Specifications:  Domtar Brand 

as specified or buyer approved equal.
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Liberty Paper Canary Yellow (Domtar 81196) 2500 REAMS NO BID

Liberty Paper Green (Domtar 81197) 2500 REAMS NO BID

Liberty Paper Pink (Domtar 81198) 2500 REAMS NO BID

Magtec Corporation Blue (Domtar 81199) 2500 REAMS NO BID

Magtec Corporation Canary Yellow (Domtar 81196) 2500 REAMS NO BID

Magtec Corporation Green (Domtar 81197) 2500 REAMS NO BID

Magtec Corporation Pink (Domtar 81198) 2500 REAMS NO BID


